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paperback. Book Condition: New. Ship out in 2 business day, And Fast shipping, Free Tracking number will be
provided aCer the shipment.Paperback. Pub Date :2012-01 Pages: 64 Publisher: Beijing Normal University Press
sheet: 4.25 Beijing Normal University - nine-year education curriculum standards (a total of 17 subjects)
(excluding Japanese Russian) compulsory education curriculum standards (2011 annual edition) oIicially
issued the compulsory education curriculum standards (2011 edition) published exclusively by Beijing Normal
University Press. at the same time supporting the publication of the compulsory education curriculum
standards (2011 version) Interpretation Series with the new version of curriculum standards analytic teaching
guide books. Compulsory education curriculum standards is the compilation of teaching materials. teaching.
assessment and examination questions based on the basis of national management and evaluation of courses.
reflecting the state of knowledge and skills. processes and methods. emotional attitudes and values ??of
students at diIerent stages in basic requirements. provisions of the nature of the course objectives. content.
framework and teaching and evaluating proposals. In 2001. the compulsory education curriculum standards
promulgated by the Experimental DraC oIicially launched. marking a new round of reform of China's basic
education curriculum. Explore curriculum reform achieved remarkable results aCer 10 years of practice. built
with Chinese characteristics. and reflect the spirit of the times. reflecting the concept of quality education basic
education curriculum system. With the deepening of the basic education curriculum reform. in order to meet
the requirements of the full implementation of quality education. and to improve the quality of compulsory
education. the Ministry of Education organized experts on the compulsory education curriculum standards
were revised. Currently. according to the results of the deliberations of the Expert Advisory Committee of the
Ministry of Education for basic education curriculum materials in the Ministry of Education. basic education
curriculum materials expert working committee....
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